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MIMUTES OF A PUBLIC HCARING AND DEGULAR MUETING OF THU MAYOR
AND BOARD OF ALDERMEN, [OWS OF CHAPEL HILL, MUNICIPAL BUILDING,
MONDAY, OCTORER U, 1978, 7:30 P.M,
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Marilyn Boulton

Gerald Cohen

Robert Eptina

Jenathan Howes

Beverly Kawalec

R. D. Smith

Bill Thorpe

Edward Vickery oo

Also present were Town Manager E. Shipman, Town Attorney E. Denny, and
Deputy Cierk M, Harkins,

Resolution of Appreciation - Katherine Klinaberg

Mayor VWallace read the following resolution.

WAEREAS, Mrs. Katherine Klingberg served as a member of the Chapel Hill Beard of
Adiustment from September 21, 1970 until July 30, 1978, and

WILEREAS, Mrs. Klingberg accepted the responsibility of her appointment and performed
:h dedication and integrity, and

Wi

Wi FREAS, Mrs. Klingberg gave unselfishly of her energy, time and talents in contrib-
uiing to the work of that body;

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the Mayor and Board of Aldermen of the Town
of Chapel Hill, on behalf of all of the citizens, express appreciation to Mrs.
Klingberg for the excellent job she has done, and

BE 1T FURTHER RESOLVED that this resolution be signed by the Mayor and each member
of the Board of Aldermen and a copy be duly filed with the permanent records of
the Tcwn.

Yhis the 9th day of October 1978.

ON MOTION BY ALDERMAN EPTING, SECONDED BY ALDERMAN BOULTON, THE
RESOILUTION WAS ADOPTED.

Minutes

Yr, Shipman announced that the minutes of the meetina of September 25, 1870,
were not  completed due to the lengih of the meeting., Thevy wouid be
distributed prior to the next meeting.

Peritions andd Reauests

Alderman Vickery requested the Board to add to the agenda discussion
authorizina o study to investigate the feasibility of the town owninc and

concrating a cable television franchise. In response to Alderman Smith's
question, Alderman Vickery stated thet  this was an allowable pubiic
3

erttaerprise. The Board aareed io add this item to the agenda.

Alderman Howes asked for a meeting to discuss the candidates dfor the
Managor's position, This matter was addaed o the end of the agenda,

Mr. Hinds requested o be aliowed to make & stoterment on itom

the Fiscal Yoo

Mr, Shipman stated that when the recomemended budaet and the GO0 bhad boeon
v thavr o deciaion bhe Jolbaved o dhe

considered, the Manaoer had recommencs

a budact for the projects at Plant Dond aod Hacaravens, oo Bhod

adoption of
the otaff and the Poarks and Recreation Conandsstion miahe Turibers sty
two proposals and that input aiaht be obtained Fors the preojecta. The oo
and Parks and Recreation Conmniosion wero now sGhmiiting a recominenaation

i
for thoce projects. These includod indao: poel, avisas o, moebing e ior
feciee, a0 dobby siie dovelopment ot Clant fhoad, andd Pocne T beprovemeniin !
Ploararaves providingg venovatioes to e es bofing cenrer,  expaoieaoa G
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conter s

public raeciings heddg ot dhaarees bt sununer, The pesiddenta b
prioritized neoveral Ttomes as befoo fportsnt, 1) renovation of the center, (2)
a meeting house seating up 1o 500 pearde, (3) day care renovations,  (4)
resource center, (5) a kitchon and (6) lanedd acquisition., Ms., White listed
second and third prioritics os well,  The staff  and Commission  weoere
recommending first and second tlosr renovition, an addition of 1500 =sq. ft.,
pool repairs, landscaping, furni=hings and resurfacing the basketball court.
Thewv falt thic weaddd FOLF T mact f thia mosrde maevcimoam o §end h:: v e
Land acquisition was not recommended. With the schools in the arca, it was
hoped that school facilities would be used for other purposzes. Alderman
Boulton asked why the Commission had rocommended taking classroom space
from the community center and adding it to the ncighborhood center. Ms.
White did not think they were taking it away from the community center., She
felt the moncy would be well spent at tlargraves, and that the space was
needed there.

Alderman Howes asked what would be done with the Pubiic Works Building on
Plant Road. Mr. Shipman answcred that a portion of this would be used for
office space. No decision had been made on the rest of the space. Alderman
Boulton suggested the slabs and stack micht be renovated for ithe same
amount as it would cost to tear them down. Mr. Shipman stated that when the
design was done, use of these buildings would be considered. Alderman Cohen
asked for an estimate for the compietion of the Plant Rord and Hararaves
facilities. Mr. Shipman estimated it would take at least two yvears for the
Ptant Road facilities and one year for the Hargraves facilities.

Alderman Smith questioned whether the bus aarage building would be moved
or whether it would be left cn the Plant Road site and used. Mr. Hooper
answered that although it was planned to move this building, they had found
that it was almest an economical to build a new building as to tear down and
move the old one. The Beard might want to consider other alternatives.

ALDERMAN HOWES MOVED, SECONDED BY ALDERMAN BOULTON, ADOPTION OF THE
FOLLOWING ORDIMNANCE.,

AN ORDINANCE TO AMEND THE "ORDINANCE CONCERNING APPROPRIATIONS AND THE RATSING
OF REVENUE FOR THE FISCAL YEAR BEGINNING JULY 1, 1978"

EE IT ORDAINED by the Board of Aldermen of the Town of Chapel Hill that che Rudget

Ordinance entitled "An Ordinance Concerning Appropriations and the Raisine of Rovenuo

for the Fiscal Year Beginning July 1, 1978" as duly adopted on June 12, 19738, be
and the same is hereby amended as follows:

ARTICLE I

_Budg_e_zE Increase Decrease Revised

Capital Budget 2 371 590 1 780 500 - 4152

ARTICLE II

Budpet Incrcase Decreasc
Capital Budget 2 371 590 1 780 500 - 4 152

All -ordinances and portions in conflict herewith are hereby repealed,
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ard a neighborhood center, Mr. Hinds stated thai the Do cEec Dy
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tf’ be spent at Hargraves had been cui. He ol thia was a bad neeocedont, A
A . ) L , . .
Hararaves stated the priovities orescited by Mo, White were ot thoos of e
community. Alderman Smith asked what thoe priseities of ine community vre

M " . - . e . -
Mr. Hargraves said the prrioriiios wore pesovation,  additional space i b
rorm  of  an  annex to secat 360 e 500, and land acquisition. M. Fioopes

Fra pe s A e ) -
After bhaving tAr. Hooper explein the difference Between a community centor

explained that the proiects would be bacle before the Doard for viddn < At
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that time the Doard miaht have to put in anegae Ghiceinates,
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At che erman - Gmi th thouaht  the 525,000 hinis - Padscapimg, e Hewngy o

oxplained that this fneluaded si'e Brrdnoae, wallwaye and land<caning filt

MOTION WAS CARIIIED UNANTMOUS Y, .
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Bl T4 RESOLVED by the Board of Aldevien ol Che Town of hh»p:l ijl‘!ha{ the Pm&;d

hereby directs the Town Manager to place a manv b by—operated trallic stpnal ot

Lhe rodestrian crosswalk in the 100 block ol k. Franklin Strect; in acoordance
redestri: CTO5

i 5 Lo . 5 code of Ordin s oof ¢ Town of
with the provisions of Section 21-15 of the Code of Ordimamces of th

Chapel Hill.

This the 9th dav of October, 1978.

Aldermar. Howes asked if the matter had bezen reviewed by the Transportation
Board. Mr. Shipman answered ihat it had not been revicewed by the
Transportation Board, but had hbeen reviewed by the Streets and Pubiic Safety
Committee and the desiagn of signals had bcen reviewed by the Appearance
Commission. Alderman Kawalec commented that one of the benefits of Chapel
Hill was that the pedestrian still had pricrity over a car. With proper care
she felt that accidents could be avoided. Alderman [Epting suggested stricter
enforcement by police would help to prevent accidents. Mr. Shipman described
the poles as metal painted brown, with mast arms suspended across the
strect. The Appearance Commission had considered a number of alternative
designs. Mr. Shipman felt the wvolume of vehicular and pedestrian traffic
great enough to warrant a signal. ALDERMAN KAWALEC MOVED, SECONDED BY
ALDERMAN BOULTON TO REFER THE MATTER TO THE TRANSPORTAT (0N BOARD,
FOR A RECOMMENDATION AT THE EARLIEST POSSIBLE TIME. Alderman Smith
thought that referring it to the Transportation Board would just delay the
matter. They had already studied the matter two years ago and recommended
a signal not be put at this crosswalk. He wanted some regulation at this
walk. THE MOTION TO SUBSTITUTE WAS CARRIEDR BY A VOTE QF FIiVE TO THREE
WITH ALDERMEN BOULTON, EPTING, HOWES, KAWALEC, AND VICKERY SUPPORTING
AND  ALDERMEN COHEN, SMITH AND THORPE OPPOSING. THE MOTION WAS
SUBSTITUTED WAS CARRIED BY A VOTE OF FIVE TO THREE WITH ALDERMEN
BOULTON, EPTING, HOWES, KAWALEC AND VICKERY SUPPORTING AND ALDERMEN
COREN, SMITH AND THORPE OPPOSING.

Ordinance Amending Chapter 21 of the Code of Ordinances of the Town of

-ttt bt

ALDERMAM SMITH MOVED, SECONDED BY ALDERMAN VICKERY, ADOPTION OF THE
FOLLOWING ORDINANCE.

AN ORDINANCE AMENDINKG CHAPTER 21 CF THE CODE OF ORDINANCES OF THE TOWN OF
CHAPEL HILL (Parking Removal and Fire Lane)

BE IT ORDAINED by the Board of Aldermen of the Town of Chapel Hill that the Poard
hereby amends Chapter 21 of the Code of Ordinances, Town of Chapel Hill, as follows:

SECTION 1

ADD to Section 21-27, No parking as to particular streets, the line:

Street Side From To
Hilitop Street West Full Length

SECTION 11

ADD to Scction 21-20.2, Fire Lancs, the line:

Name Description Length Width
Spying Lane Running North from . Roscemary 420 feet T4 7. 5 i

Street at a point 225 feet
Fast of Hendersen Streot

SECTION 117

A Lo Socticu 21-27.4(¢), No parking during covtatn hours, the line:

S5reet Side FFrom To

Hilltop Street st Full Leupth

Sothe 99 h day o G ober 1ae,




Appeal from Dr, 0. David Garvin on Reguest tor f,:f,"“i.“!mz_il Parlking Permil

Dr. Garvin had requested the town amend ils special parking permit policy
relative to stackina vehicles in o driveway when all vehicles wore under the
control of one family. The Streets and Fubiic Safety Committee had considered
the matter dand recommended denial of the reauest. This amendment would boe
jor lthe personal convetrence oo Qdi vt e
special parkina permits had been denied on this bosis. ALDERIAAN EPT!NE
MOVED, SECOMDED BY ALDERMAN THORPE, THAT THE PETITION BE DEMIED. THE
MOTION WAS CARRIED UNANIMOUSLY.

instatly (VXN Rw] [ A I Ljidn.sts .

Speciali Parking Permits

ALDERMAN VICKERY MOVED, SECONDED BY ALDERMAN EPTING, ADOPTION OF THE
FOLLOWING RESOLUTION.

A RESOLUTION DENYING SPECIAL PARKING PERMITS

BE IT RESOLVED by the Board of Aldermen of the Town of Chapel Hill that the Board
hereby finds regarding the below-listed applicants for special parking permits
as follows:

1. The applicants are not domiciled on strects on both sides of which in front
of the applicants' domiciles parking is prohibited at somec time:

Address Applicant # Affixed

215 Henderson Street Susan Catherine Page 1

215 Henderson Street Martha J. Hecdrick 1

215 Heﬁderson Street Susan M. Lynch 1

215 Henderson Street Sue Bowers ‘ 1

204 W. Cameron Avenue James Df Horne 1

204 V. Cameron Avenue Andrew W. Robinson 1

406 Ransom Street Susan B. Holt 1

2. The applicants have a practical way of parking off the public right—-cf-way
the vehicles for which permits were requested:

329A Tenney Circle Robert J. Hazelgrove, Jr. i

329A Tenney Circle 1. Faison Hicks 1

514 North Street Mrs. Janie S. Gwynn 1

205 University Drive Charles Andre Barbera 1

303A Brookside Drive Laurance D. Pless 2

312 Tenney Circle Mrs. William T. Couch 2

211 Hillsborough Strcet George Ramsay 2

THEREFORE, the Board herceby denies special parking permits for the above-listed
applicants.

Th

is the 9th day of Gctober, 19678.

Mr. Shipman stated that he and Ms. Dfignazio wore investiaathna  the
Interchurch Council matter. A report would be peady by ihe 530th. Howover, it
appeared that it wouid not be in tne fown's interest to amend theier poiicy.

Alderman Doulion thouaht that since the Strects and Public Safery Commition
did all the rescarch on the pariking perood, thoy ohould make the finad
decisions. Mr. Shipman stated that this was noe poassible andaor e tiing
teqgistation,  Mr,  Denny  stated  that courd decisions  bad  invlicated e
jeqislation could be changed to allow  ihis. T MOTION WAS  CARBELD

UNANTMOUSLY .

ALDURMAN SMIETH MOVYED, SCCONDITD DY ALD DRAN P TING, ADOPTION OF T

FOLL OV ING RSO0 O,
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BE1T RESOLVED by (he Board of Aldermen of the Town of Chaped Uill that the Board
hereby Cinds veparding the below-Tisted applicants for special parking permits

as follows:

1. The applicants are domiciled on styects on hoth sides of which in front of
applicants' domiciles parvking is prohibited at some ey and

2. The applicants have vehicles which they have no practical way of parking
of f the public ripht—-of-way; or there is no practical way in which two guest
vehicles in addition to applicants' own vehicles (if any) may be parked off
the public right—-of-way; and

3. In the opinion of the Town Engincer, it would be possible to construct each

parking space for applicants' wvehicles for $300 or less; and

THEREFORE, the Board hereby grants the following special parking permits for the

period August 1, 1978 through July 1, 1979; however, such permits shall not be

renewed without a showing that all the circumstances contemplated in Section
1-27.2(c), Code of Ordinances, Town of Chapel Hill obtain:

Address Applicant # Affixed # Guost
303-A Brookside Drive John 1. Mabe 1 2
202 Vance Street Wiliiam V. Collins 1 2
615 E. Rosemary Street Daryl L. Weavil 1 2
615 E. Rosemary Street Michael Scott McDade 1 2
208 Glenburnie Henry D. Jefferson 1 2

This the 9th day of October, 1978.

THE MOTION WAS CARRIED UNANIMOUSLY.

ALDERKAN EPTING MOVED, SECONDED BY ALDERMAN SMITH, ADOPTION OF THE
FOLILOWING R&SOLUTION.

A RESOLUTIO! GRANTING SPFCIAL DPARKING PRIFILTS (RENEWABLE)

BE IT RESOLVED by the Beard of Aldermen of the Town of Chancl Hill that
the PRoard heraby finds regarding the bhelow-listed applicants fer special
parling permits as follows:

1. the am")lir*cmt are domiciled on strects on hoth sides of ohich in
front cf applicants' domiziles parling is prohibited at some tirs;
and

2. the applicants have vehicles which they have no practical way of
parking off the public right-of-wvay; o©x therce is no vractical way

in which two guest vehicles in addition to applicants’ oun vehicles
(1f any) may be parked off the public right-of-way; and

2, in the opinion of the Town Engineer, it would cost more than $08010
to construct each parking space for avplicants’ vehicles ot the
public right-ef-vay; or in the opinion cof the Doaznd, such consiractic
would raquire the destruction of an area or objcct of historicn
or natural significance f£o the Pown s a whole; and

1-

THERITFORE, the Beoard herchy crants the followving special prnykinh pooos s
for the veriod August 1, 12786 through July 1, 1979 and zt(tr\.m.x»'«-’.?r
theveafter for rurther cne-yvear poriods upon a showing ol no ohvinge
in circunstances:



Dneress e hpRid et AT ied 7 Guest
307 Ranson Streot Dorothy Ianlin 1 2
306 Nenderson Streoct Trudy Gole 1 2
211 nillsborough Street Genena Scott ' 2 2
311 V. University Drive 1. Dean Dovker 1 2
311 W. University Drive Dr. 0. bavid Garvin n 2
309 Ranson Strecet Helena Cierasinowvicz 0 2
211 Hillsborough Street George Ramsey 0 2

Thié the 9th day of October, 1978,

THE MOTION WAS CARRIED UNANIMOUSLY.

Resclution Authorizing Executicn of a Contract for a Transit Plannina Grant

ALDERMAN HOWES MOVED, SECOMDED BY ALDURMAN SMITH, ADOPTION OF THE

FOLLLOWING RESOLUTION.

A RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING EXECUTION OF A CONTRACT FOR A TRANSIT PLANNING GRANT

WHEREAS, the Board of Aldermen of the Town of Chapel Hill has recuested the Urban

Mass Transportation Administration and the North Carolina Deparitment of Transportation

to provide $13,500 to the Town of Chapel Hill for the continuation of transit
planning; and

WHEREAS, the Tcwn of Chapel Hill, North Carolina desires to provide $1,500 to
support this pirogram;

2

Town ol Chapel 11ill, North Carolina be and they hereby are authorized and
empowered to enter into a contract with the Department of Transportation as may
be necessary to effectuate the aforesaid expresscd purpose, thereby binding the

NOW, THEREFORE, BE AND IT IS HEREBY RESOLVED that the Manager and Clerk cf tho

said Town to the fulfillment of its obligations incurred under sazid confrzc: and

this resolution.

This the 9th day of October, 1978,

THE MOTION WAS CARRIED UNANIMOUSLY.

Resolution Anprovinag Educational Leave and Authorizina Submittal of an
UMTA Training Grant

ALDERMAN THORPE MOVED, SECONDED BY ALDERMAN SMITH
FOLLOWING RESQLUTION, '
A RESOLUTION APPROVING EDUCATIONAL LEAVE AND AUTHORTIZING SUBMITTAL OF AN UiTA
TRAINING GRANT

BE IT RESOLVED by the Poard of Aldermen of the Town of Chapel Hill that the Roard
: $115 2 o . ; attend Nort he
hereby approves educational leave for William E. Callahan, Jr., to attend North

castern University's twenty-second Urban Mass Trasspoertation Management Scwinar
2 - 1 C ‘ . 3o - ~ TN F ~ oyt R
on November 0-17, 1973, and May 14--25, 1979, suliject to a formal contract in

(

accordance with Scction 14-88 of the Code of Ordinances: and

BE O TT FURTHER RESOLVED that the Board herehy authorizes ithe Town Managoer (o appisy

d 75 i i [ - . i - N S AN S S-S & VA T SEN, FEN Ay
for a 70% manaperiai tvaini ne oprant in the amount of 83,495,000 [rom Lhe UMIA 2w
poriial tundiog for participation in (he above manasement =eminar, and o hoo
duihorizes the Town Manoger to execnte such {urther documents and assucanees

may be reguived Tor sasd praat.

This the 9th dav ol October, 1978, .
i, O

Caltanan, there was  a possibility that he condd get o suhobarashirs wivich
Y

woutd poay o loe taition ond part of his salary. Dy ordinamee; if an ciiployoeen
H
RES

el Tor more than % davs, Be st Goree (o v
as he owas away, THRO MOTEORN WAS CARBTE D UHANTEOHSLY.

Recolution Degoarding Sunport for §oie Houne,
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THAT WHEREAS, the Deprriment of Hess i ano Urban Deve bopment }1&5,‘111||11u!u‘<ﬂl_t|n
Noew llorizons program o urge communitics toward Lhe development of Tocal Fair

Housing standards; and

WHEREAS, the Town of Chapel HiJl has for many years endorned and supported open
and fair bhousing for all persons within the Town, and has had since carly 1908
Urulnances proniniling QusCl LU 105 i (Ui i, FiLun iU U adlarGi g e

standards cqual to or greater than those contained in cxisting federal laws, and

those recommended by the New llorizons program, and

WHEREAS, the firm commuitment of the Town of Chapel UHill continues to be the
eclimination of improper discrimination in hovsing.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY I ROARD OF ALDERMEN O THE TOWN OF CHAPEL HILL,
that the objectives of the New Horizons program of the Department of tousing and
Urban Development are hiereby endorscd, and the Town reaffirms its commitment with
regard thercto as set forth in the Ordinances prohibiting housing discrimination
within the Town.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVLD, that a copy of this Resolution, duly certificd by the
Clerk, be transmitted to the Department of Housing and Urban Development.

This the 9th day of October, 1978.

THE MOTION WAS CARRIED UNANIOUSLY.

Resolution Calling a Smecial Public Hearina to Consider the Tennev Mea-
dows Unified Housing Development Special Use Reques:

M. Denny stated that the ordinance provided that special use requests by
developers would be heard at specified times throughout the year. However,
the Board upon the finding of an emergency situation, could call & special
public hearing. The resolution before the Board would set the backaround for
the emergency. ALDERMAM SMITH MOVED, SECONDED BY ALDERMAN EPTING,
ADOPTION OF THE FOLLOWING RESCLUTION,

A RESOLUTION CALLING A SPECIaL PUBLIC HEARING TO CONSIDER THE TENNEY MEADOWS
UNIFTED HOUSING DLEVELOPMENT SPECIAL USE REQUEST

THAT WHEREAS, the Board of Aldermen of the Town of Chapel Hill at its regular
meeting in July postponed its consideration of a duly scheduled subdivision
development request involving the Tenney Property to its regular meeting on
September 11, 1978 to permit investigation of alternatives for the use of said
property, and

WHEREAS, the matter was regularly calendared on the agenda for consideration of
the Board of Aldermen at its regular meeting on September 11, 1978, and

WHERFAS, at said meeting, as the result of discussions between Mr. Tenney and
Members of the Board of Aldermen, the developer is now proposing a uniflicd housing
development for said property, and

WHRREAS, the Board indicated that in the event such a proposal was made, it would
consider scheduling it at a public hearing to be called as soon as practical
thereafter, and

WHERFAS, the developer has requested that said matier be set for a public hearing
at the October 30, 1578 wmceting of the Board.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE BOARD OF ALDERMEN that by reason of the past
delay in the consideration of the proposced development of the Tenncy Propoicty,
that an emergancy exist warranting the calling of a special hearing on the curyemt
roposal for the development of said property, and

BE 1T FURTHER RESOLVED TUAT THE BOARD OF ALDERMEN OF THE TOWN OF Citar#t HILL herohy
calls a public hearing on caid unitied housing development special use regnest

for the mecting of the board of Aldermen scheduled for Octobeyr 30, 1978,

This the 9th day of October, 1978,
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Report on the Special Use Permit Neauest of Southern Bell
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Mr. Shipman stated that at the last mecting, the Board had directed him to
investigate the possibility of obiaining additional cvidence on the following
matters: (1) potential damage caused o the Old Methodist Churech by
construction, (2) the queston of the public necessity of the facility proposcd
by sSouthern tetl, (3) the question 01 potentia’ aamandge o the vatue ol e
adjacent property caused by the addition to Southern Bell, and (4) the
reasonablencss of the cost estimates to locate the proposed addition to the
rear of the existing building, and the eficet of this on the rate structure. It
had been determined that a stractural enqaincer could be retained to render
an opinion for approximately $1500. However, in Mr, Shipman's opinion therc
was not a discernabzle difference in the cviderice presernted by botih sides on
potential damage. The matter of public nocessity could be determined by a
representative from the State Utilities Commission if an eopinion was requested
by the town. Mr, Shipman asked whether the Board wanted an opinion on the
necessity of placina the equipment where Scuthern Bell proposed, or anywhere
in the town. Alderman Howes said he had bheen satisfied as to the location,
but wanted to know the necessity of upgrading the equipment. Alderman
Epting felt there was an issue of the necessity for the location of the
equipment on the west side as oppozed to the north side. He added ihat the
applicant had admitted there might be damage to Mr. Webu's building., The
burden of proof that there would be no damnze was on the applicant.

Mr. Denny explained that a multi—-purpose building could be constructed on
the site without Board permission. It wvas only the use for switching
equipment which brought the matter befcre the Board., The Board might
consider the use of the buildina. He did not believe the Utilities Commission
would give such detail as the necessity cof the addition on the west side as
opposed to its necessity on the north side. The Board should consider whether
the danger to the public safety would be increased by the use as a
telephone exchange. Mr. Denny felt the Becard needed more evidence on this
point., Mr, Shipman asked if he sheould pursue information on the
reasonablencss of cest and the irnpa(‘t on  the rate structure. ALDERMAN
VICKERY MOVED, SECONDED BY ALDTRMAN SMITH, THAT THE BOARD DIRECT THE
TOWN MANAGER TO GET THE ADV 3S§ OF THZ UTILITIES COMMISSION ONM THE
QUESTION OF PUBLIC NECESSITY ({ THE FAC ll ITY AND THE REASONADLENESS
QF THE COST ESTIMATES AND THE POTENTIA
COSTS WOULD HAVE UPCON THE TELZPHOM
MOTION WAS CAREIED BY UNANIMOLS VOTE

L EFFECTS RESULTIMG IHNCREASEDR
1E RATE STRUCTURE IN THE ARZA, THE
F:

Discussion and Possgible Action Renarding thf\ Proposed 1979 Municipal Leais-
lative Goals and Policy

Mr. Shipman stated thai the staff and attorney had reviewed the coasis and
policy of the League of Municipalitics Legisiative Pregram. There were areas
which the Board might wish to recommend their ideas be included in the
league's provoed policy: local gas tax and sales tax on items other than food
and drugs, tax or privilege license for restaurants selling beer, wine and
mixed drinks, legisiation to aliow cities of 25,0060 or more to have
extraterritoerial authority over land area 3 miies cutside iis boundary without
repect to whether the county is exercising jurisdiction in that area, qgererai
enabling leaislation for eminent domain and oppose local repeal, and
endorsing the use of Power Rill funds for support for local public
transportation systems. The Board agreed to recommend that these be inciuded
in the League's proposed ifegislative proaram,

Bids

ALDERMAN HOWES MOVED, SECONDED DY ALDERMAN KAWALLEC, ARORTION OF THE
FOLLOWING RESOLUT!ICN,

RESCLUTION ACCEPTING BIDS FOR PETROLLUMN PRCDUCTS, AUTOMCTIVE ARD HEATINC

’
ducts, Automotive and Heating and the following bids have been received:

Bl(.dnis s & Bida

M.M. Fowlev [.‘wnltnoy 0il
Jgems | . I & Gt Co.  Mexieo. Tnc.
119,000 callons leaded gasoline $53,785.00 $56,703.50 £55,930.00
07,000 pallons lead-free '
pasoline ‘:‘{;_2’_)“{/‘) G0 $31,054,50 $30,652.50
158,000 ¢allons #1 dienel fuel SOU,000 00 I F04,0%7 .40 SH L 09,80
£5,000 patlons #2 dicsel fuel ¢ (\,‘,, b OO0 o {», 94, 'm e iip
o pallons J20 tael oil 3 4,000 00 : 107, HOO B TD
M tahr o st Prodine s ’ AN B ‘f,”l‘,‘i,ll'i LS00

the Town of Chuapel HIME hos seliciicd formd!l bids foer Poetlrotounm Pr
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Underlincd fLoms are yocomsetived Lo

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Board of Aidermen of the Town of Chapel
Hill that the Town accepts the bid by fW.W. Fowler, lInc., for leaded ond unlcaded
‘gasolinc, and lubricoting supplies in the awmcunt of 392,185.35 and the bid by
Gwaltney 0il and Gas Co. for #1 and #2 diesel fucl and #2 fuel oil in tho omount
of $73,999.85.

. This the 9th day of October, 1978.

THE MOTION WAS CARRIED UNANIMOLISLY .

ALDERMAN EPTING MOVED, SECONDED BY ALDERMAN HOWES, ADOPTION OF THE
FOLLOWING RESOLUTION.

A RESOLUTION ACCEPTING BIDS AND AWARDING OF COHTRACT FOR MATERIALS FOR TRAFFIC

CONTROL SIGNS

WHEREAS the Town of Chapel Hill has solicited formal bdids for Materiais for
fraffic Control Signs and the following bids have been received:

Bidder and Bids

Southeastern Safety

Item . 3 Co. Supplies, Inc.
I. Sign Faces A. - D. $3,031.60 $3,224.22
ft. Lleliers, Numerals & Symbols A. - D. 248.63 No Bid

E. o 5,658.50 3,068,044
T, Miscellsnecus

A. 5000 Ib. street marking Powder 10,845.00 8,250.00

B. 50 road and bridge delineators 440.00 867.50

C. 20 "Slow HMoving Vehicle"™ Emblems No Bid 150.00

D. - E. Roll goods 1,471.50 1,590.C0

F. Silk Screen Cleaner No Bid No Bid

Unit Cost Items

10 different sign faces : $73.29 total $85.47 total
{range: $2.66 {range: $7.36
cach fo $11.50 to $14.31
each] each)

.4 types lelters, numerals and symbols ' $9.68 total No Bid

- trange .79/pky.
Cto 5.23/pkg.)

Rotl Coods . 327.00/rol 335.00/voll

Vorious Silk Screen Process Colors . Prices/qaiton frices/galton
{range 20.90/gat, {range 27.75/cal,

“fo 97.80/q9al.) to 82.93 gal.)

Thioner . 5 -

- 270/gat, 7.707001,

NOW THEROEORET, B 1T RESOLVED by the Beard of Aldgermen of the Town of Chanel

HiLE thot the Town accepts the bids by Southoastorn Satety Supply [nc. for otreet
marking  nowadeor,  and Slew Soving Vebicle ot dems in the amount  of
the blde by 50N Coo for the remainder of  the fean fesciuding unit oot ifens)
P the corount of 20,8500 ang that S andt cont Bide by ;S‘-ZM Coe be oo pied

Al
for poonible purohince during the yoour,

ST . ) . )
L T N fll\ S T N B B ¥ + . Yoyt
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THE MOT IO WAS CARRIED URAMNIMOITILLY .,
ALDERMAMN EPTING MOVED, SECONDED BY ALDERMAN VICKERY, ADOPTION O 1L
FOLLOWING RESOLUTION,
A RESOLUTIOH REJECTING BID FOR THE CONSTRUCTION OF WilLOW DRIVE BOX CULVERT
BF IT RQFSOLVED bv the Board of Aldermen of  fthe Town of Chanel Hill that the
Town hos received the following bids for the Construction of Willow Drive Box
Culvert:
Bidder Bid .
R.G.K., Inc. - $92,500

Burlington, N.C.

AND BE T FURTHER RESOLVED that the Board hereby rejects the bid as being over
the budgeted womount.

This the 9th day of October, 1978.

THE MOTION WAS CARRIED UNANIMOUSLY.

ALDERMAN EPTING MOVED, SECONDED BY ALDERMAN VICKERY, ADCPTION OF TiHE
FOLLOWING RESOLUTION.

A RESOLUT!IOM

ACCEPTING BIDS AND AWARDING CF CONTRACT FOR ONE THREE VIIEEL, GASO-
L INE~ POWERED . _

POLICE VEHICLE

WHEREAS, the Town of Chapel Hili has solicited formal bids for Onc Three Wheel,
Gasoline-Powered Police Vehicle and the following bids have been received.

iiddeg

‘Eastern Turf Equipment Inc.
Fayetteville, N.C.

Goin Equipment Sales, Inc.
Charlotte, N.C.

Bid

$4,365.00

$4,615.85

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Board of Aldermen of the Town of Chapel
Hill that the Town accepts the low bid by Eastern Turf Equipment, inc. in the
amount of $4,365.00.
This the 9th of October, 1978.

THE MOTION WAS CARRIED UNANIMOUSLY.

ALDERMAN EPTING MOVED, SECONDED BY ALUERMAN THORPE, ADOPTION G THE

FOLLOWING RESOLUTION.

-T8G4DD



[ AR H S LS BRI CA T R B RELSTNNE P SRt et U L e e ey,
HUEAVY Dby, b uaid o R S0 i

WHIRLAS the Town of Chapel Hill has solbicited formal bids for One Frond Cutting,
Heovy Duty, Riding Laan Mower and the following bids have been received:

Bidder Bid

R ” . . + . -~ AN FOC A
R R L O N e S O A D R

Carrboro, N.C.

High Point Lawn and Garden Equipment Co. $2,650.00
High Point, N.C.

Durham Saw and Mower Co.} Inc. $2,650.00
Durham, N.C.

Hood Equipment Co., Inc. ' $2,695.00
Goldsboro, N.C.

Porter Brothers, Inc. $3,100.00
Shelby, N.C.

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Board of Aldermen of the Tcwn of Chapel
Hiil that the Town accepts the low bid by Andrews & Riggsbee Trector Co. in
the amount of §2,595.

This the 9th dav of October, 1978.

THE MOTION WAS CARRIED UNANIMOUSLY .

ALDERMAN EPTING MOVED, SECONDED BY ALDERMAN VICKERY, ADOPTION OF THE
FOLLOWING RESCLUTION.,

A RESOLUTICON REJECTING GIDS FOR SHELVING FOR AUTOMOTIVE PARTS AND SUPPLILS

BE IT RESOLVEp by the Board of Aldermen of the Town of Chapel HHill that the
Town has received the foilowing bid for Sheiving for Automotive Parts and

plics: Sup-

Ridder : Bid
Southern Parts & Electric, Inc. $1,?6SoOO
Chapel Hill, N.C. n

AND BE 1T FURTHER RESOLVED that the Bowerd hereby rejects the above bid as not

P being respensible fo the solicitotion of bids by the Town.

“This the 9it doy cf October, 1976.

THE MOTICH WAS CARIED UNANIMOUSLY.,

ALDEIMAN SMITH MOVED, SECONDED BY ALDURMAN HOWES, ADOQPTION OF  THE
FOLLOWING RESOLYITION,



/} A RESOLUTION  ACCOPTIHG RIS ARD ANARDI HGO 00 COINRACT TOR 10 BRI T
ACGUGTICAL SCRELN PANLLS

WHCRCAS the Town of Chapel Hill has solicitod formal bids for 111G Linear ool
of Accoustical Screen Pancls and the following hids have been receitved:

Bidder Bid
Ralcigh Office Supply 7 4' pancls® $1,140.00
Raleigh, N.C. _ 5 5" panels”® 1,112.00
i 3' pancl $ 164,15
9 0 pancls® $2,154.00
TOTAL $5,051.55
Partitions, Inc. 14 4 panels $2,2063.00
Raleigh, N.C. 6 4'0" panels $1,092.00
1 3' panel $ 122.00
4 §' panels $ S065.00
. TOTAL $4,450,00

#This bidder bid different size pancls than specified but the total lincar feet
and the spatial arrangements proposcd would be the same aud its bid is, there-
fore, equivalent.

NOW THEREFORE, BE 1T RESOLVED by the Board of Aldermen of ihe Town of Chepel
Hill that the Town accepts the bid by Partitions, inc. for fourfeen 4' panel
one 3' panel and four &' penels in ihe amount of $3,358.

14

LW

This the 9th day of October, 1978.

THE MOTiION WAS CARRIED UNANIMOUSLY.

Commitiees

Alderman Thorpe had nominated Barbara Bostih for the vacancy created by the
term  exniration of Alderman Howes, OWASA submitted the name of Betty
Sanders as well.

David Hinds, Riley Wilson and Ronald Rindfuss had been nominated ito fill a
vacancy on the Planning Board for a term ending June 1980. Mr. Rindiuss
received a majority of five votes and was elected.

Cable TV

Alderman Vickery wanted the town to investigate the possibility of its owning
and operaling a cable television franchise. The profits could be used to
finance the purcnase of land for parks, or to pay the dcbt service o a bond
issue for land acauisition. Mr. Denny had said it would be legal for the town
to operate a franchise. Mavor Wallace named Alderman Vickery (Chairman},
Alderman Epting and Mr. Shipman to an ad hoc committee to investigate this
matter.

Alderman Howes wanted to have a meeting to establish criteria for the now
town manaqer. He suggested ecoch Board member choose ten or tweniy
applicants they were mest interested in and the tisis couvid be putl togeoethoer.
The Board decided to meeting Oclobor 16, at 7:30 nam.

5

There heing no further business to come hefore the Board, the mooting was
adjournead,

itayvor Jomnee OO Waltlace " |

Town Cierlk David 3, Roborts A Dtiee - Ny
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TOWN OF CHAPEL HILL

306 NORTH COLUMBIA ST.
CHAPEL HILL, N.C., 27514
(919) 929-1111

NOTICE OF SPECIAL MEETING OF THE
BOARD OF ALDERMEN OF THE TOWN OF CHAPEL HILL

p0: Marilyn Boulton
Gerald Cohen
Robert Epting
Jonathan Howes
Beverly Kawalec
R. D. Smith
Bill Thorpe
Edward Vickery

You, and each of you, are hereby notified that the Board of Aldermen

have called a Special Meeting, to be held in the Conference Room ’
at 7:30 p.m. on October 16 , 1978 , to méet In executive
séssIon to dlscuss personnel matters. .
irToR |

ACCEPTANCE NOTICE

We, the undersigned, members of the Board of Aldermen of the Town of

Chapel Hill, hereby accept notice of a Special Meeting of the Board of
Aldermen, called by Honorable James C. Wallace , Mayor, to be held in
the Conference Room, on OctobeF I6, 1978, &t 7:30 p.m. , .

W O R e

ﬁ MAYOR







