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MINUTES OF A MEETING OF THE MAYOR AND BOARD OF ALDERMEN
TOWN OF CHAPEL HILL, MUNICIPAL BUILDING, MONDAY, NOVEMBER 13, 1978
7:30 P.M,

pa.. . ~ -~ - o oy .. v - _ .
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Marilyn Boulton
Gerald Cohen
Jonathan Howes
Beverly Kawalec
R.D. Smith

Bill Thorpe

Also present were Interim Town Manager E. Shipman, and Town Attorney E.
Denny.

Mayor Pro Tem Epting announced that Mayor Wallace was ill and would not be
at the meeting. Alderman Vickery was excused.

Mayor Pro Tem Epting stated there had been several requests to move
consideration of the parking study up on the agenda as there were several
citizens present to hear the discussion. Alderman Cohen added that many were
also present for the discussion of closing portions of Halifax Road and Cedar
Street, HE MOVED, SECOMDED BY ALDERMAN HOWES, THAT THESE ITEMS BE
CONSIDERED AFTER ITEM 6. There was no objection.

Minutes : -

On motion by Aliderman Howes, seconded by Alderman Boulton, the minutes of
October 30, 1978, were approved as corrected; .

S samiatide -

Petitions and Reqguests

Ms. Bertie Howard, representing the Orange County Day Care Coalition,
solicited the Board's support to get i{he North Carolina Social Services
Commission to adopt better standards for federally certified day care centers
than those currently recommended by the Division of Socia! Services staff.
North Carclina has asked for and received from HEW a waiver freeing them
from requiring federally certified day care centers to meet the current federal
interagency day care requirements and allowing them to establish their own.
The standard:s proposed are the double A standards adopted by the North
Carolina Office of Child Day Care Licensing. The state hoped to lower cost in
day care centers and serve more children by lowering their standards. The
coalition supported lowering the cost and serving more children, but not by
fowering the standards. Ms. Howard explained that the coalition felt the cost
had been skewed and why. Going to the double A standards in Chaoel Hill
would not result in serving more children, rather fewer would be served.
Proposed ratios had such a high number of children per staff, the group size
would be limited. The room size would then be limited to only one group.
Approximately 20 teachers would be put out of work. The coalition felt the
state had not looked at other alternatives for lowering costs such as bringing
the countiy day care centers down to the maximum reimbursement program.
They could not support the proposed standards because the high ratio of
children te staff would create a safety hazard; community centers could not
provide special services; and a high reputation had been established in this
area which would be hurt by these new standards. ALDERMAN KAWALEC
MOVED, SECONDED BY ALDERMAN BOULTON, ADOPTICN OF THE FOLLOWING
RESOLUTION AND  THAT THIS RESOLUTION BE FORWARDED TO THE NORTH
CAROLINA SOCIAL SERVICES COMMISSION.
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it P m mlyin byt BDoenrd of  Aldorminen of the Town of Chapel HHTE thiat

the  Board  cndorces  the oropocals of  the Orange County Day Care Coalition

for higher standards for licensing day care centers to include the following:

1) Staff-child ratios for certified centers should be lowered as follows:
1:5 6 weeks - 2 years 1:10 5 vyears
1:7 3 years 1:12 6 years and older
1.0 4 vanne
2) Space--30 square fect/child/indoors; 75 square feet/child/outdoors.
3) The tightening un of the licensing standards to a level somewhere between

the present "A" and "AA" standards.

4) All  staff-child ratios, for both licensed and certified centers, should

be based on enrollment and not average attendance figures.

5) The present reimbursement rate should be maintained (neither raised
nor lowered) for at least six months to allow stabilization in centers

and to analyze the effect of the new staff-child ratios in the state,

6) More equity in program exnenditures and no money for sunnort services

where such services are provided by octher agencies and »rograms.

such services are not available special allowances (perhaps with state

monies) should te made to nrovide necessary services,

7) The state should assume greater monetary responsibility for insuring

that more of North Carolina's Children receive quality day care.

This the 13th day of Novembher, 1972.

She asked why the state was lowering the standards. Ms. Howard ressonded
that North Carolina was one of nine states enforcing the federal standards.
And, the money allocated to day care was rapidly spend and with the demand
increasing they were tooking for ways to serve more chiidren. THE MOT!ON
WAS CARRIED UNANIMOUSLY.

There were several requests to be allowed fto speak on items to be considered
by the Board. Mavor Pro Tem Epting indicated anyone wishing to speak would
be allowed to do so. ’

Mr. Shipman stated that the attorney for Harris-Conners had requested the
modification of the special use permit for Harris-Conners not be considered as
they anticipated filing an application soon for additional modifications and
wanted the Board to consider all of the modifications together. Alderman
Kawalec objected because Harris-Conners is not in compiiance with their
special use permit. She asked if a specific date cculd be set for consideration
on these items. Mr. Jennings answered that he did not know when thev would
be applying, but he did not want to cut the staff review time. He felt that
the Board would have a better position for insisting on compiiance with the
landscaping plan with the additional applications. ALDERMAN KAWALEC
MOVED, SECONDED BY ALDERMAN SMITH, THAT THE BUILDING INSPECTOR BE
REQUESTED TO NOTIFY HARRIS-CONNERS THAT THEY WERE NOT IN COMPLIANCE
WITH THEIR SPECIAL USE PERMIT AND THAT THE SIGN WHICH HAD NCT BEEN
APPROVED SHOULD BE REMOVED. THE MOTION WAS CARRIED UNAKMMOUSLY.
ALDERMAN COHEN MOVED, SECONDED BY ALDERMAN HOWES, TO DELETE
CONSIDERATION OF THE MODIFICATION TO THE SPECIAL USE PERMIT FROM THE
AGENDA. THE MOTION WAS CARRIED UNANIMOUSLY .

Mr. Shipman requested the Board to meet in executive session at the end of
the meeting to discuss personnal matters. There was no objection from the
Board.

Resolution Granting a Child Day Care Center Special Uszse Peormit to Syca-
more School incornorated

ALDERMAN SMITH MOVED, SECONDED BY ALDERMARN BCOULTON, ADOPTION OF THE
FOLLOWING RESOLUTION. '
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BE IT RESOLVED Ly the Poard of Aldeimen of ihe Town of Chapel 11911 that
the Roard hereby finds that the Chi 1 d Day Care Centor proposced by
Schonl, Ince. if developed in accordance with the plans submitted

Sycanore
stipulations and conditions set foxth below:

with tLce application and the

=

1. will not naterially endanger the public health or safety if
located where proposcd and developed according to the plan as
subnmitted and approved,

2. meets all required conditions and specifications,

will not substantially injure the value of adjoining or
abutting property, and

: that the location and charactexr of the use if QOVOTOped
according to the plan as submnitted and approved will be in
harmony with the area in which it is to be located and in
general COWLOIMJLY with the pldn of development off Chapel Hill

and its cnvirons.
The stipulations upon which the above findings are based are as follows:

1. That the building and grounds conform to standards set by the
State of North Carolina for Child Day Care Centers or to OUUlleent

Federal cay care standards.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the Board hereby grants a Child Dbay Care
Center Special Use Permit in accordance with the plans as submitted and
approved and the stipulations above.

This the 13th day of lloverber, 1878.

THE MOTION WAS CARRIED UNANIMOUSLY.

A Resolution Granting a Day Care Center Snecial Use Permit to Binklev
Child Care Center

ALDERMAN HOWES MOVED, SECONDED BY ALDERMAN THORPE, ADOPTION OF THE
FOLLOWING RESOLUTION.

7 ) RESOLUTION GRANTING A CHILD DAY CARE CENTER SPECIAL USE PERMIT TO
BINKLEY CHILD CARE CENTER FOR THE OPERATION OF A DAY CARE CENTHER WITHIN
THE EPISCOPAL CHURCH OF THE LiOLY FAMILY AT 200 HAYES ROAD

BYE IT RESOLVED by the Board of Aldermen of the Town of Chapel #Hill that
tbe Board hereby finds that the Child bay Care Center proposed by
Binkley Child Care Center if developed in accordance with the plans
submitted with the dyDllCatlon and the stipulations and conditions set
forth below:

1. will not materially endanger the public health or safety if
located where proposed and developed dC(O]Ulng to the prlan
as subinitted and approved,

2. meets all reguired conditions and specifications,

bo will not substantially injure the value of adjoining or abutting
property, and

4. that the location and chavacter of the use if developed according
to the plan as subnmitted and approved will be in harmony with the
arca in which it is to be located and in ¢eneral conformity with
the plan of development of Chapel Hill and its environs.

The stipulations upon which the above findings are bascd are as follows:

1. That the building and grounds conform to standards set by the State
of Noxth Carolina for child d.v care centers. '

BE LT PURTHER RESOLVED that the Roavd 11("t(~§13/ grants a Child Day Carve
Center Special Use Permit is acceovdance with the plans as subnitted and
approved and the stipulabions abhove.

This the 13th day of Yoveabor, 19783,
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aporoximately 5C% more parking than was recuired ‘3\/ UG,

Mr. Denny pointed out that althoual ciiizerns coule offor their opinion on the
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project now, no further evidence could ¢ considerced by the Board of

Aldermen witheout readvertising and reopening the nublic he aring.

Mr. Olsen acked the Board to consider parking and access for the project, If
parking was not available, visitors to the natients would be discouraged. He
beliced the control gate would be 2 psychological deterrent for visitors.

Mr., Clifford Sturdevant complimented the pla inning on this project. He had
faith in the demonstrated ability of Hillhaven to construct and manage gecod
facilities,

Mr. Atkins pointed out that the parking requh“oments were eqgual to or greater
than recuirements in other communities and comnolied with Chapel Hill's

£

ordinance. The zccess gate was by the request of the town staff.

R CO .EN MOVED, SECONDED BY ALDERMAN THORPE, ADOPTION OF THE
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‘bhe Roaxrd of Aldermen of the Town of Chapel Hill that
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That {he access drive ot Bllioit Road be appropriately signed to

indicate its restricted use for nursing home residents and theilr
guests.

That the Roard of Aldermen find that a 50% reduction in parling
for the residential arca is appropriate for the proposed usn, Lhat
the reduction will not result an a nazarceus tratiic conditicn,
the land not used for off-strect par)ing be used for additional
landscaping, and that the parling requircement for the residential
units be reduced 50%.

That the proposed sidewalk along Franklin Strect be paved to
Town standards.
pearance

That detailed architecctural elevations, and a’ site plan showing the
location of landscaped arcas, sians, lighting and other site clements
be subnitted to and approved by the Appearance Comnission prior to
issuvance of a building peinit. :

g. That a detailed landscape/p anting plan including detailed sign
and lighting plans be submitted to and approved by the Appearance
Commission prior to issuance of a certificate of occupancy.

10. That the bulk trash containers be screened and that this screening
be shown on the detailed landscape/planting plan.

1). That any and all planting which dies during the life of the special
use pernit be replaced with planting of the same species and
approximately the same size by the end of the next planting scason.

12. That the off-street parking area e screened from the abutting
properties to the north, west and south by a solid six-foot high
screen consisting of vegetation and/or fencing. The detailed
design of such screen shall be shown on the landscape plan.

That as much significant planting as possible be rectained and
that such planting be shown on the landscape plan. Existing
planting shall be protected during construction by appropriate
fencing or barriers. Provisions for such protection shall be
shown on the landscape plan.

14. That paved areas be set back as far as possible from trees to
-be retained.

15. That the applicant identify on the landscape plan those treces
which require a trece feeder system to ensure the continued
provision of proper tree nourishment, including adequate water,
air, and nutrients to the root system of said treces. The design
specifications for such a tree feeder system and the proposed
specifications for its installation shall ‘be shown on the land-
scape plan, and shall be reviewed and approved as part of the
landscape plan.

Other Stipulations

16. That a drainage plan be submitted to and approved by the Town
Manager prior to issuance of a grading permit or building permit.
Improvements included in the drainage plan shall be completed
prior to issuance of a certificate of occupancy.

That provision for garbage collection be approved by the Town
Manager. : .

18. That construction begin by December 1, 1980 and be completed by
December 1, 1982.

19. That fire hydrants as required by the Town Manager be provided within
the proposcd developnent.  The nurbey, locatieon, and installation
of such hvdrants shall be approved by the Town Manager.

id
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This the 13th day of lovenber, 1978,

While aware that additional housing for the ciderly was needed in Chapel
Hitl, Alderman Kawalec did not believe this nroject was the type of housing
Chapel Hill wanted. The open space for a residential devetopment of this size
would be 88,000 sq. ft. Alderman Kawalec did not think the Board should
differentiate between onen space for younger people and open space for the
elderly. She was also concerned with the proposed parking. She asked the
Board to use its option not to allew the 50% reduction for the residential
units. The parking for both facilitics was combined, and if aill 45 employees
drove to the nursing facility there would be little parking left for visitors’
and residents. The apartment residents would need supportive services
supplied in Orange County by volunteers who would be driving. It should be
made easy to provide these services. Alderman Howes agreed with Alderman
Kawelec, Mr. lJennings explained that the project had been listed under the
special use permit for nursing home so that the town could require greater
safety measures such as sprinklers in every room. The staff believed the
project to be more of a nursing home/auxiliary unit than a unified housing
project. The applicant had provided open space although it was not required.
The largest shift of employees would he between 7 a.m. and 3 p.m. which was
a time that not many people visited the nursing home. Most visitors would
come at night or on the weekend when there would be less employees.

Alderman Epting thought only one access was needed, that on Elliott Road.
The traffic on Franklin Street would make turning hazardous. A small sign
on Franklin Street could easily direct visitors to the entrance on Elliott
Road. Mr. Jennings responded that two accesses were needed for safety, and
with two, Franklin Street was the most logical. Alderman Epting then
suggested limited left turns from the facility. He asked if any consideration
had been given to stacking residential units on top of the nursing facility to
give more open space. Mr. Atkins said that Mr. Jennings had been in error,
that including the cetback vyards, the project had 107,117 sq. ft. of open
space. He added that Hillhaven had found that occupants of the nursing
facility and occupants of the residential unils were not congenial socially or
in day-to-day activities. Therefore the two tenants were not mixed. The
extreme fire code requirements for the nursing facility also discouraged the
stacking.

Alderman Cohen felt the issue of open space and the parking incompatible.
More parking could be provided only by reducing the open space. He
suggested that rather than more parking, there should be less units on the
property.

Alderman Howes asked if Hillhaven had taken into account that the land
would be increasing in value, the taxes would be increasing, but the
residents would be on fixed income and wouid not be able to pay more in
future vyears. Mr. Atkins said that Hillhaven was aware of the vaiue of the
land. By moving the project out to the edge of town, the amenities such as
the closeness of the shopping centers would not be available. ALDERMAN
KAWALEC MOVED, TO AMEND THE RESOLUTION BY ADDING THE FOLLOWING
STIPULATIONS:

20) That the project comply with the Town's requirements for open
space for unified housing projects;

21) That a solution satisfactory to the Town Manager be found ior the
Franklin Street access;

22) And that the applicant provide one parking space per residential
unit as well as the spaces provided for the nursing facility.

Mr. Jennings asked for a clarification on the open space. Alderman Kawalec
indicated that the setback yards could be inciuded in the 1,200 sq. ft. per
unit. Mr. Jennings explained that the anplicant had already wmet this
requirement. Alderman Kawalec felt the parking spaces were needed bocausc
the residents would either have a car or would have someone else to do
chepping for them who would need a space. Alderman Cohen argusd ihat the
shopping center was less tha.. 50 vyvds. away. Alderman Smith wanted more
parking svace for the nursing facility as well. Alderman Boulton asked if the
town's park- ride lot in Kroger Plaza could be used at times for overf{low
parking from the facitity. Mr. Hooper stated that the lease on the nark-ride
lot would soon be up. Alderman Boulton then agreed with Alderinan Coben that



A

FOR THLE

BE

Billhaven,

the Board herceby finds that the
Ine. if developed in
11, 197 8 and the stipulations

RESOLUTLON

aguast

1

The

Wi
lo

(A A IRERLE N R : O
sufficiont tand 1o e mordiine
motion and still comply withe the

her  motion,

MOVED ADOPTION OF

withdrew
KAWALEC,

)t

NG A
Tl OF

ST0G

WS 111G

(G0

IRADIE:
pUC !

EN

Yy
Ivey 1y

o0

IT RESOLVED by the TPoard of Aldermen of
Tursing gl
dance with the plans

11 not material ly cndanger
cated vhere

sulriiticed and approved,

AL DAL
THi:

VU

GCCOU

(DI EE TR IR S FE NS S & R TS A GO éo
Eoocomply with Alderman Kawaleo s
soesy conce reauirenmesnt, Alderman Kawaleco NCY 13
O HOWIES M(')\/ED, SECONDED  BY  ALDERMAN

FOLLOWING

AFDEDIL NS IS R B B
Facinaiy

the
cinee Yo

and condit

the public hea

RESOLUT HON.

IR BRIPAVINH
FUALNT I SY

i
1602

IJ\(')
pAGT

o1
AL

Town of Chapel 131111 thot

cilily proposed Ly
Aot ed

jons set forih Lelow:

Jth or safely if

nroposced and developed according to the plan as

spceifications,

arca in which it is to be located and in general conformitly

the plan of development of Chapel Hill

and its environs.

stipulations upon which the above findings are based are

Traffic and Safety

1.

2

3.

4.

5.

6.

7.

That a paved sidewalk be constructed between 1) the nursing facility.
2) the residential structure and Elliott Road,

3) the nursing facility and the proposed sidewalk along Franklin St.

‘and Elliott Road,

That all sidewalks be constructed in comp
Handicapped Code for wheelchair access.

Carolina

liance with the

’7(“

2

meets all reaguired conditions aond

will not substantially injure the value of adjoining or ~hutting

property, and

that the location and character of the use if developed ccording

to the plan as submitted and approved will be in harmony wiih the
21th

follows:

and

riorth

That markings and/or warning signals be provided where paved side-
Such markings or devices shall be

walks cross internal

streets.

approved by the Town Manager.

That a paved access drive from Elliott Road be provided.

That the access drive at Elliott Road be appropriately signed to
indicate its restricted use for nursing home residents and their

gucsts.

That one parking smace for each residential

unit be provided.

That the proposed sidewalk along Franklin Street be paved to

Town standards.
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Far as possible from trees to
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Other Stipulations

i "o & OPI : t ot
That a drainage plan be submitted to and ;pp{ovcd‘Eylzbc T :nw_t
Manager prior to issuance of a grading permit Or building pngl .
Aé [& eSS g1 = . 7 - : e
Improvements included in the drainage plan shall be complete
y . 3 _ r -~ <y
prior to issuance of a certificate ol occupancy.

16.

That provision for garbage collection be approved by the Town
Manager. .

18. That construction begin by December 1, 1980 and be completed by
December 1, 1982.

That fire hydrants as regquired by the Town Manager be provided within

i lopment » T} cation, and installation
the proposed development. The nwreher, location,

} T by t Ton Manager.
of such hvdrants shall be approved by the Town Manag

20. That the apnlicant nrovide onen shace for the residential units, as re-
quired by ordinance, of not less than 1200 csg. ft. per dwelling unit.

21, That there be no left-turn access onto Frankiin Sireet.

22. And that the residential structure contain not more than 56 units.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the Roard hereby grants a Nursing Jionme
Special Use Peviit in accordance with the plans as submitted and approved
and the stipulations above. '

This the 13th cCay of loverber, 1978,

ALDERMAN THORPE MOVED, SECONDED BY ALDERMAN SMITH, TO REFER THE

MATTER BACK TO THE STAFF TO DISCUSS THESE CHANGES WITiH THE DEVELOPER.
Mr. Atkins said Hillhaven was willing to accept the changes proposed by
Alderman Howes. Alderman Thorpe withdrew his motion. ALDERMAN SMITH
MOVED, TO AMEND THE MOTIOM TO PROVIDE 76 SPACES FOR THE NURSING
FACILITY. The motion dies for lack of a second. After more discussion,
Alderman Howes indicated his intention was for the size of the residential
units tonp be as first proposed. Alderman Howes called the question.
Discussion was ceased by unanimous consent., THE MOTION TO SUBSTITUTE WAS
CARRIED BY A VOTE OF SIX TO ONE WITH ALDERMEN BOULTON, COHEN, EPTING,
HOWES, KAWAILLEC AND THORPE SUPPORTING AND ALDERMAN SMITH OPPOSING. THE
RESOLUTION AS AMENDED WAS ADOPTED 3Y A VOTE OF SIX TO ONE WITH
ALDERMAN BOULTON, COHEN, EPTING, HOWES, KAWALEC AND THCAPE SUPPORT.-
ING AND ALDERMAN SMITH OPPOSING.

Resolution Directing Development of Phase ! of the Parkina Study

Mr. Hooper stated that the parking study had been authorized in the 1977-78
budget. !t had been undertaken to determine sonte of the critical issues in
term of lorng and short term parking, location of parking and purposes for

the parkina., In addi*  information is necded to nrepare for financing more
parking. The resolu:- before the Roarda authorizing Phase 11 had been
endorsed by the Tr srtation Board, the Chambeoer of Commoerce parking
commitiee, and the Mo - 's commitice on parking. The stalf recommernded that

Phase 1l consider the ilowing elements: metering additional spaces in the
West Rosemary  Street, Roberson Ste, Graham Strect ared; the feasibility of
constructing ot parking deck on the land owned by the town, parking tot #1



arvdd Ui et o Lo o withy by ccipizition of two surrooe parking lots o in éz’
the West PFranlkdin Sicect area;  the strategy for dealing with long-  term "
parking: interim measures for parking if construction is 1o take place; and MOV 13
purchase of land now lecased by the town. Phase |} would take approximately

9 weeks. In response to a question from Alderman Howes, Mr. Hooper stated

that the staflf hoped to present the recommendations as a complete package.

Mr., Watts  Hill expressed the  support of  the Chamber of Commerce
Transportation Committce for the staff's recommendations. He also raised some
questions o pe answered in the study such as type of construction, r(*.V(?nue
financing, a change inparking charges, enforcement of on-street parking,
employee and student prking, the Liniversity's parking plans, the role of the

CBD. The Committee also questionced the quality of the Wilbur Smith report,
ALDERMAN SMITH MOVED, SECONDED BY ALDERMAN KAWALEC, ADOPTION OF THE

FOLLOWING RESOLUTION,
A RESCLUTTON DIRUCTING DEVELOPILNT OF PHASE 11 OF THE PARKING STUDY
BE 1T RESOLVED Ly the Poard of Aldervien of the Town of Chapel Hill that the Town
Manager is dirccted to further develop the following clements in Phase 11 of the

Parking Study jn order to jmplement a parking developient program,

1) Metering curb spaces in the arca of West Rosemary, Graham, and Roberson
Strecets.,

2) Construction of a parking structure on existing Town-cwned land at Parliing
Lot #1.

3) Acquisition of two surface parking lols in the West Franklin Street area.

4) Further development of park/ride lots to meet long-term parking needs.

5) Plane for leasing parking spaces during the construction phase of the pro-
BLEram.

This the 13th day of November, 1978.

Aldernyan Cohen suggested special tax districts also be considered for the
flnanC}ng. Alderman Smith added that his intent was for the study to consider
those items listed by Mr. Hill. THE MOTION WAS CARRIED UNANTMOUSLY.,

Resolution of Intent to Close Unopened Portions of Halifax Road and Cedar
Sireet

ALDERMAN SMITH MOVED, SECONDED BY ALDERMAN HOWES. ADOPTIO
£ ED BY \
FOLLOWING RESOLUTION. , ’ OF THE

A RESQLUTION OF INTENT TO CLOSE UNOPENED PORTIONS OF HALIFAX ROAD AND CLDAR STREET

FE«IJ R%SOLYEDFby ?hg Board of Aldecrmen of the Town of Chapel Hi11 that the Board
erchby declares 1ts intent to permancntly close the unopened portion of Halifax

Road betyecn Grany1]1e Road and Burlage Circle, and the unovened rirht—ofi’ﬂ
between Burlage Circle and Cedar Street, crossing Cole Sprihg Brancﬁ; and -

5? 1{ fQRTHER.RESQLVED that the Board hereby calls a public hearing on the auestion
of C Qg1ng s§1d iLP?e? at 7:30 P.m. on December 11, 1978, in the Héeting Roon of
ie Chapel Hill nunicipal Building, 306 MNorth Columbia Street,

This the 13th day of November, 1978.
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THE MOTION WAS CARRIED UNARTMOULLY.

Resolution Anproving a Preliminary Sketch for Phase 8 of the Coker Hills
West Suhdivision Located Ot Wellington rive

Mr. Shipman was recommending that the item be tabled so that the developer
micght »orcun the slternative of ot aoecone G Diney  Mountaia Noad.
Alderman Howes asked if this had been discussed with the developer. Mr.
Jennings answered that it had but that he had disagreed with this
recommendation at the Planning Beard mceting. e added that at the time of
the Planning Board meeting there had not been a proposal for developing the
property off Piney Mountain Road; howcver, a development impact assessment
had now been filed for that property. LEven without this, the staff felt access
should be from Piney Mountain Road. ALDERMAN HOWES MOVED, SECONDED BY
ALDERMAN COHEN, THAT THE MATTER BE TABLED PENDING DISCUSSIONS BETWEEN
THE DEVELOPER AND THE STAFF. Alderman Epting added that the Board did
not take this action to delay this project but to expedite it hoping that these
discussions would take place as soon as possible., THE MOTION WAS CARRIED
UNANIMOUSLY .

Rescolution Authorizing Negotiation to Exchange Land

Mr. Shipman explained that the Miketas and their attorney had arranged for
an exchange of land, the portion of town property they had encroached upon
for a greater portion of land located contiguous to Cedar Falls Park. The
Development of Housing and Urban Development would have to review and
approve the exchange. ALDERMAN HOWES MOVED, SECONDED BY ALDERMAN
THORPE, ADOPTION OF THE FOLLOWING RESOLUTION,

A RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING NE
ment ) COTIATION TO EXCHANGE LAND (Miketa Encroach-

BE
ol lgo_iiSOkI:VE% by the .Boar‘d of Aldermen of the Town of Chanel Hill that
a ereby authorizes the Town Manager to arrange the exchange of

1170 square feet of Cedar F
alls Park to Dr. & Mrs i
square feet of simijlar pronerty adjoining said park 7o Andrew Miketa for %900

This the 13th day of November, 1978,

THE MOTION WAS CARRIED UNANIMOUSLY.

Resolution Granting a Modifi i i
e g Tication of the Special Use Permit for University

ALDERMAN COHEN MOVED,

SECOND ~ R Ml
FOLLOWING RESOLUT1on . ED BY ALDERMAN SMITH, ADOPTION OF THE

A RESOLUTION GRANTING A MODIFICATTON OF “HE SPRCTIAL USE DPERMIT FOR
UNIVERSITY MALL -

BE IT RESOLVED by the Board of Aldermen of the Town of Charel 11111
that the Special Use Permit granted to North 1ills, Tne. for Uniﬁorq4tv
Mall Unified Business Development, South Estes Drive is herchy ﬁndffiod
to allow the ercction of two entrance signs on the Mall buildinué'A
22§§2wiigfatlon as shown on plan; dated May 4, 1978 sunject to the

That cxcept as modificd herein, all other smecial terms, conditions
and stipulations heretofore made applicable to the Special Use .
Pexrmit be continued in effect, and that the Roard finds that ’

with all stipulations and conditions as rodified, the use continues
to meet the four requisite findings set forth in {he init—jai .

special use permit. o

BE IT PURTHER resolved that the Board of Aldermen finds that the use
as modified in accordance with the plans dated May 4, 1978 <:on(:{nn;~s;
to meet the four findings made by the Board of Alderi:en on Soutbmbér 9
1968 (and subsoquently modified). S

This the 30th day of October, 1978.



el the met environce sign to the facia

fhe application had

65 Mr. Stevens aoxplained the relarion oo
would be the wame as the existing Uriversity Mall sian.
by customers who c¢ouldn't telt the mall entrance from store
entrances on the back side of the mati., The University Mall sign designated
the main entrance and the pronoscd signs would designme other entrances.
Harry Smith stated that it was difficult to dircect out-of«rowr.v customer‘i to
shops when the mall entrance was nolt markoed. Mr, Mcl.aurin, from Flr‘st
Union, stated that the bank had changed its loqgo in the State and would ||k.e
to change the sign at the mall. Alderman Epting was concerned that.thls
would open the door to other logos at the mall. He wanted to keep the uniform
signage. ALDERMAN HOWES MOVED, SZCONDED BY ALDEMAN KAWALEC, ADOPTION
OF THE FOLLOWING RESOLUTION.

been nrompted

A RESOLUTION GRANDING A MODIFICATION OF THE SPECIAL USE PERMIT JOR
UNIVERSITY MALL

BE IT RESOLVED by the Board of aAlderizen of the Town of Chapel 11311
that the Swvoecial Use Permit granted to lTorth Hills, Tnc. on Sentonbher 9,
1968 for University Mall Unificd Business Develoonent, South iotos
Drive is hereby vodified to allow the erection of twoe ontrance 5igns
on the !all building's north eclevation and the replacenent of the
three existing signs on the First Union National Bank building with
two new signs as shown on plans dated May 4, 1978 and hvgust 18, 1978
subject to the following:
That except as modified herein, all other special terms, conditions,
and stivulations heretofore i1rade applicable to the Special Luse
Permit be continued in effcct, and that the Board finds +hab
with all stipulations and conditions as modified, the use continves
to meet the four requisite findings set forth in the initial
special use permit. :

t
a

BE IT FURTHER RRESOLVED that the Board of Aldermen finds that the use

- as modified in accordance with the plans dated May 4, 1978 and August 18,
1878 continues to mect the four findings made by the Board of Aldermen on
September 9, 1978 (and subsequently modified).

This the 30th day of October, 1978.

THE MOTION TO SUBSTITUTE WAS CARRIED BY A VOTE OF FOUR T VITH
ALDERMEN BOULTON, HOWES, KAWALEC AND THORPE SUPPORTING /A?Nngl_EfDEEF\RY\:EIf:
COHEN, EPTING AND SMITH OPPOSING. THE MOTION WAS SUBSTITUTED WAS
CARRIED BY A VOTE OF FOUR TO THREE WITH ALDERMEN BOULTON, HOWES
KAWALEC AND THORPE SUPPORTING AND ALDESMEN COHEN, EPTING A!:JD SMITf,%
~OPPOSING. Without five votes, the resolution could not be adopted. It was to
be carried over toc the next meeting. ALDERMAN COHEN MOVED, SECONDED BY
ALDERMAN HOWES, TO RECONSIDER THE PREVICUS MOTION. TH‘E MOTION WAS
CARRIED BY UNANIMOUS VOTE. THE RESOLUTION WAS ADOPTED BY A VOTE CF
FIVE TO TWO WITH ALDERMEN BOULTON, COHEN, HOWES, KAWALEC AND THORPE
SUPPORTING AND ALDERMEN EPTING AND SMITH CPPOSING.

Parking Permits

ALDERMAN SMITH MOVED, SECONDED BY ALDERMAN THORPE, ADOPTION OF THE
FOLLOWING RESOLUTION,

A RESOLUTION CRANTING SPLECIAYL PARKING PERMITS (RENEWARBLYE)

BE JT RESOLVED by the Doard of Aldermen of the Town of Chapel Hill
that the Board hereby finds regarding the below-listoed applicants
for special parking permits as follows:

1. the applicants arc demiciled on strceeits on both sides of which
in front of applicants' domiciles parking is prohibiled at sonme
time; and

Z. the applicants have vehicles which they have no practical wiy of
parking off the public richt-of-way; or there is no practical Wiy
in which iwo guest vehicles in oddition to cpplicants' own vehicles
(1L any) nay be parled of £ the public vight-of-way; and

3. din the opinion of the "own Ingincer, it would cost more than $S£200
to consizrect cach parking space for apnlicants' vehicles ol the
public ryiocht-ol-way; or in the cpinion of the Board, such constrnction
would yooguire the destruction of oan o aves or object of histoirical or
natwral significance Lo the Toun aa o vhodoe; and



Pitk o rs, Lhe Board Leseby grants ihe follovins cpecioaol parkhing permiis
for the period angust 1, 1978 through Jaly 1, 1979 ond rencwable thoere-
after for Inrther one-year periods upon o showing of no change in NOV Ly ’

circumstances:

nddress . hpplicant o # Affixed 4§ Gnest
309 Ransom Strecet William Hill 1 0
1 Briarbridge Lane Virs. John W. Parlkoer 0 2
412 Whitchead Circle F. C. Crittendeﬁ 0 2

is the 13th day of November, 1978,

THE MOTION WAS CARRIED UNANIMOUSLY.

ALDERMAN SMITH MOVED, SECO'IDED BY ALDERMAN HOWES, ADOPTION OF THE
FOLLOWING RESOLUTION.

A RESOLUTION DENYING SPECIAL PARKING PERMITS

BE IT RESOLVED by the Board of Aldexrmen of the Town of Chapel i1l
that the Beard hercby fails to find regarding the below listed
applicants for speccial parking permits that the applicants arc
domiciled on strects on both sides of which in front of applicants’
domiciles parking is prohibited at some tinme:

Address Applicant # Affixed
302 Henderson Strecet Juleigh Muirhead 1

-2 IT . FURTHER RESOLVED by the Beoard of Alderrmen of the Town of
Chaepel 11111 that the Board hereby fails to find regarding the helow-
listed applicants for special parking permits that the applicants
have vehicles which they have no practical way of parking off the
public right-of-way:

Address hpplicant £ Affixed # Guest

205 Vance Street Terri Colangelo 1

205 Vance Strcet Deborah Dawson 1

205 Vance Street Mary Beth Mulhalland 1

215A Vance Stréet John F. Engell 1l

216 Vance Street Hilda B. Medlin 1

224 Vance Street | , Melanie P. Lewis 1l

29 Tenney Circle | Mr. & Mrs. Johﬁ Allen Cates 2
17 Wilson St. Inter—-Church Council 2

This the 13th day of Noversber, 1978.



THEL MOT IO WAL CATED B3Y A VOTL G SEX TO ONE WIETH ALDERMEN COHER,
EPTING, HOWES, KAWALEC, SMITH AND  THURPE SUPPORTING AND ALDERMAN

BOULTON OPPOSING.

Alderman Kawalec asked that the statf, the Transportation Board and the
Streets and Safety Committee reconsider the stacking policy since most of the
appeals dealt with this policy. Alderman Epting said the stacking policy wa
not the nrohlem. it was the powillinanace F :
and out of their drives. Mr. Shipman explained that if the stacking policy
was reversed then the Board weould be deciding to allow cars to park on the
streets. Stacking is an intrinsic part of the ordinance. Alderman Enting
pointed out that it was also inconvenient for residents who must construct a
drive within a ycar if they had room. ALDERMAN SMITH MOVED, SECONDED BY
ALDERMAN THORPE, ADOPTION OF THE FOLLOWING RESOLUTION.

recidante tn mavn thods cors i

A RESOLUTION DENYING APPLAL OF PARKING PERMIT REQUEST

BE IT RESOLVED by the Board of Aldermen of the Town of Chapel Hill that the Board
hereby denies the sppeals of the following persons from the previous decision of
the Board denying Special Parking Permits:

Dr. & Mrs. Thomas Muzum : 213 N. Boundary Street
Mrs. Janie Gwynn : ‘ 514 North Street
C. W. Shields ‘ 227 Vance Street
Mrs. W. T. Couch 312 Tenney Circle

This the 13th day of November, 1978.

THE MOTION WAS CARIED BY A VOTE OF SiIX TO ONE WITH ALDERMEN COHEN,
EPTING, HOWES, KAWALEC, SMITH AND THORPE SUPPORTING AND ALDERMAN
BOULTON OPPOSING.

Ordinance Amending Chanter 21 of the Code of the Code of Ordinances of
the Town of Chapel Hill

The proposal was to remove iwo parking spaces on the west side of North
Columbia Street for the creation of a loading zone and that the existing bus
loading zone be extended in a northerly direction such that the zone would
accommodate two buses during the peak bus periods., This is a major transfer
point for the buses. During off peak periods the bus zone and the loading
zone would be suverimposed to give more room for service vehicles. ALDERMAN
SMITH MOVED, SECONDED BY ALDERMAN HOWES, ADOPTION OF THE FOLLOWING
ORDINANCE,

AN ORDINIHCE AMENDING CHAPTI'R 21 OF Tl CODE OF ORDINANCES OF YHE
TOWH OF CHAPEL HILL (Bus/Loading Zone on N. Columbia St.)

BE TIT ORDATNED by the Doard of Aldermen of the Town of Chapel Hill
that the Reard hereby amends Chapter 21 of the Code of Ordinances,
Town of Chapel 1ill, as follows:

SICTION I

In Section 21-28.1, DELETE the lino:

Street At Dircction From To
N. Columbia Strecet Franklin St. -1, 106 20

and ADD:

N. Columbia Strcet Pranklin St. S--L 152 2
SECTION I1

REWRITE Scction 21-35 (f) as follows:

(£)  7The space along the western curb of N. Coluabia Streceol decsoribed
as follows:

Pegiming at a point 112 foot north of (he norithern cuorbline

of Irevklin Street and onding 152 Foob north of caid curbl ine
shall he reserved from 10:00 AM Lo 2:00 M, Menday throuoh Friday
as a 30 minule loading  wone, with no parviiing albiowed cxeopt

For looding and wnloading for no wmore than 30 minules ot oa Cime,



ADD a ncw Suction'2l»35 (g) to read as fLollows:

NPT e L ~ ia Street describeod
(g) The space along the western curb of N. .Columbia Strecet d
as follows:

Beginning alt a point 175 fect north of the nortthp c§r?lggg)
on IFranklin Street and ending 224 focet north of Sq%d culpllnc
shall be rescerved at all times as a 30 minuto 1oud1nq.zong,
with no parking allowed cxcept for loading and unloading for
no more than 30 minutes at a time; from 8 AM to 5 PM Monday
through Friday.

This the 13th day of November, 1978.

THE MOTION WAS CARRIED UNANIMOUSLY.,

Resolution Directing Signalization of the E. Franklin Street Crosswalk

ALDERMAN SMITH MOVED, SECONDED BY ALDERMAN THORPE, ADOPTION OF THE
FOLLOWING RESOLUTION.

A RESOLUTION DIRECTING SIGNALIZATION OF THE E. FRAMKLIN STREET CROSSWALK

BE IT RESOLVED by the Board of Aldermen of the Town of Chapel Hi1l that the Board
hereby directs the Town Manager to place a manually-operated traffic signal at the
pedestrian crosswalk in the 100 block of E. Franklin Street, in accordance with the
provisions of Scction 21-15 of the Code of Ordinances of the Town of Chapel Hill.

This the 13th day of Hovember, 1978.

THE MOTION WAS DEFEATED BY A VOTE OF FOUR TO THREE WITH ALDERMEN
BOULTON, SMITH AND THORPE SUPPORTING AND ALDERMEN COHEN, EPTING,
HOWES AND KAWALEC OPPOSING. ALDERMAN SMITH MOVED, SECONDEZD BY
ALDERMAN THORPE TO PUT THIS MATTER ON THE AGENDA OF THE NEXT MEETING
WHEN THE OTHER TWO MEMBERS OF THE BOARD WOULD BE PRESENT. THE MOTION
WAS CARRIED BY A VOTE OF SIX TO ONE WITH ALDERMEN BOULTON, COHEN,
HOWES, KAWALEC, SMITH AND THORPE SUPPORTING AND ALDERMAN EPTING
OPPOSING. Alderman Kawalec asked that the matter be put early on the
agenda so that interested persons would not have to wait through the whole
meeting.

Mr. Morris reported that the Transportation Board had recommended against
this signal because Franklin Street was the only place where the pedestrians
were dominant. The signal would be a barrier to the free flow of people.
Alderman Boulton believed the light was needed for the safety of people.

Resolution Authorizing Grant of Certain Rights-of-Way to Duke Power

ALDERMAN HOWES MOVED, SECONDED BY ALDERMAN SMITH, ADOPTION OF THE
FOLLOWING RESOLUTION,

A RESOLUTION AUTHORIZIMG GRAMT OF CERTAIN RIGHTS-OF-WAY TO DUKE POWER

: NOV 18 wg8

BE 1T RESOLVED by the Board of Aldermen of the Town of Chapel Hill that the Roard hereby

authorizes the Interim Town Manager to exccute grants of Righls-of-Way to Duke Power
Toimpany in order to provide electrical service to Cedar Falls Park and to Ephesus

ark.

his the 13th day of November, 1978.

THE MOTION WAS CARRIED UNANIMOUSLY,

Ordinance Amendinag the 1978-79 Position Classification Plan and Ordinance
to Amend "Ordinance Concerninag Appropriations and 1he Raising o Revenue

ALDERMAN COHEN MOVED, SECONED B3Y ALDERMAN SMITH, ADOPTION OF THE
FOLLOWING TWO ORDINANCES,
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BEOTT ORDAILED by the Foard of Aldermen of the Town of Chiapel Hiu .thn% the
soard hereby amends the "Ordinance Establishing a Position Classification and
- : N ) ’ y e 10 M e -
Pay Plan, cte., for the period July 1, 1978 through June 30, 1979,'" as follows:
SELIION L

In Section IV D MISCRLLARNEQUS, ADD:

POSTTION T Houzs SALARY
Personnel Ana]&st 1 37% $943-$990/month

SECTION 11

. . - . . e ro-
All ordinances and portions of ordinances in conflict herewith are hereby

pealed.
This the 13th day of Novewber, 1978.

AN ORDINANCE TO AHBEMND THE "ORDIHNANCE COMNCERNING APPROPRTIATIONS AND THE RAISING
'OF REVENUE FOR THE FISCAL YEAR BEGINNING JULY 1, 1978"

BE IT OERDAINED by the Board of Aldermen of the Town of Chapel Hill th?t‘thc Budget
Ordinance entitled "An Ordinance Concerning Appropriations and the Raising of Revenue
for the Fiscal Yecar Beginning July 1, 1978" as duly adopted on June 12, 1978, be

and the same is hereby amended as follows:

ARTICLE 1

Budget Increase Decrecase Revised
General Fund
Personnel 66 305 ' + 7 280 73 585
Sundry-
Contingency 16 915 - 7 280 9 635

All ordinances and portions in conflict herewith are hereby repcaled.

This the 13th day of November, 1978.

Alderman Thorpe was against adding up positions in the middle of the fiscal
year. Alderman Cohen argued that this position had been expected in the
goals set for the fiscal year and should be continued. Alderman Epting asked
why in negotiations with the County the Town had chosen to have other CETA
positions reinstated rather than this one. Mp. Shipman stated the County
would not accept any positions over $7200. THE MOTION WAS CARRIED BY A
VOTE OF FIVE TO TWO WITH ALDERMEN 2OULTON, COHEN, HOWES, KAWALEC AND
SMITH SUPPORTING AND ALDERMEN EPTING AND THORPE OPPOSING.

Resolution -~ Tax Releases

Alderman Epting asked if University Ford had been through bankruptcy
proceedings to climinate their iiability. Mr. Denny explained the history of
the company. The taxes now being released had been levied on the new cars
in January which had then been s=old. When the taxes became due the County
and Town found much less of value. Alderman Epting asked if any tiability
could be attached to Ford Motor Co. by reason of the merchandising
agreement., As there had been no error on the part of the tax collector, he
did not want to release the taxes due. Mr. Denny was instructed to
investigate this possibility. ALDERMAN HOWES MOVED, SECONED BY ALDERMAN
KAWALEC, ADOPTION OF THE FOLLOWING RESOLUTION.



WHERFAS, Loes 1isted below woere erronconsly Tovied

on properticos belonging to Gl following:

NAMI

Richard A. Bell
Kathy Ann Burrcll

ames Douglas Moretz

Walter N. Morrow

Lyda E. Orgain

Donnell Thompson

C. S. Whitt

pence & Lester, Inc.

Travel-On Motorcycle

Phillip Arnold
& Susan

REC. |}

09431

07554

10385

10774
06258 (1973)

05929 (1974)

00566 (1968)

08888 (1975)

07614 (1972)

Purefoy Road
Scwer Assesament

AMOUNT
$ 27.11

26.80

23.20

11.70

242.16
201.50

220.70

30.00

18.43

119.82

1,383.69

mov 18 179

Lhyongh clerical crror

REASON

Property Tisted in
Craven Counly.

Property licted in
Buncombe County.

Duplicate listing. Sow
as bill 707534, which
has been paid.

Listed in crror. Propo:
located in Carrhoro.

Charged late list on
discovercd propaerty in
error.

Valuatlion includasd a
duplex. Should only be
for a lot.

1968 outside scwer bill
with no map, block or lc!
numbers. Therefore, we
have no way to match thi
up with the proper real
estate. C.S. Whitt was
a contractor.

Open space in Durham Co.
which was deeded to the
Town 11-21-74.

Claimed bankrupty.
Personal property was so
by judge. This is the
balance which was left.

Mr. Arncld signoed an

S
agreement 8-18-78 oo
not to dovelopo thio 1o

WHERIZAS, the above listed persons have made application for release

of said taxes;

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT

RESOLVED
Chapel Hill, that it finds the taxes
levied through clerical corror, and

be relcased to the taxpayer.

BETNG FURTHER RESOLVED that
releasa.

sowered Lo make such

of

1nis the  13th day of November 1978.

THE MOTION WAS CARRIED UNANIMOUSLY.

pkh

by the Board of Aldermen of the Town of
the above listed persons woere
in the discretion of the Board should

the Tax Collecltor is authorized and

ALDERMAN BOULTON MOVED, SECONDED BY ALDIRMAN THORPE, ADOPTION OF THE

FOLLOWING RESOLUTION.



7, R . ) - ’ B ‘ SR

i

Vit .5 the Toun of Chapel i1l has solicit cd Farmal bids on Pads and Duplicacing

Papcrs and the follewing bids have been received:

BIDDER & b1 BIDDER & BiD
brame Specialty Dillard
Co. Paper Co.

Algggpgﬁp 1 Aliernate 1T Alternate 17

New Materials
(No RBid on
Recycled New Recycled
ITEM Materials Materials Materials)

A. Duplicatine Papers

1. 15 cascs white, 8%"'x11',

mimeograph paper $ 269.85 $ 269.85 $ 271,50
2. 2 cascs white, 8%'"'x14",

mimecgraph paper $  45.98 $ 45.98 $ 46.10
3. 5 cases white paper,

25% rag bond paper $ 135.50 $ 135.50 $ 215.25
4, 250 cases white,

8%"x11" paper $4,497.50 $4,497.50 $4,525.00
5. 20 cases white,

8Lv'x14' paper $ 459.80 $ 459.80 $ 438.00
6. 40 cases colored '

8%"'x11" paper $ 770.00 $ 770.00 $ 838.00
7. 16 cases colored

8%"'x14" paper $ 390.24 $ 390.24 $ 427.20
8. 3 cases white, 8%"xi1",

3-~hole punch paper NO BID NO BID $ 61.05

B. Legal and Memo Pads

1. 80 doz. 8%"x11" yelilow .

legal pads A $ 284.80 $ 284.80 NO BID
2. 20 doz. 8%"x11i" yellow

legal pds $ 53.00 $ 53.00 NO B1D
3. 60 doz. 8%"x11" white

legal pads $ 159.00 $ 159.00 NO BID
4,25 doz. 8&5"xil' wide-

ruled memo pads NO BID NO BID NO BID
5. 20 doz. 8%"x11" narrow

college~ruled memo pads NO BID RO BID NO BID
6. 2 doz. 6'"x8" wide-ruled

steno pads $ 4.98 $  4.98 NO BID

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Board of Aldermen of the Town of Chapel Hill
that the Town accepts the bid of Brame Specialty Company for seven types of

papers and four types of pads made from recycled papers (Alternate T) in the
amount of $7,070.065.

This the 13th day of November, 1978.

THE MOTION WAS CARRIED UNARIMOUSLY .

ALDERMAN BOULTON MOVED, SECONDED BY ALDERMAN SMITH, "ADOPTIOM OF THE
FOLLOWING RESOLUTION.
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L8 CALIBER

WHEREAS the Town of Chapel Hill has soticited f
the

.38 Caliber

Bidder

AR

Pevolvers

IS
PEVOLVERD

and

National Police Supply

Charlotte, N.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE 1T PESOLVED by the Boa rd
(he bid of National Police Supply, Inc.

that

C.

the Town accepts

S DDEIST RPN o P

NOV 13

orimal bLids on Fifty Stainless Steel,

foilowing bid has been received:

’
>

Bid

$4,835.50
~$3,115.00
~$  240.00
$1,528.50

50 new revolvers
Less trade-in allowsnce on 50 revolvers
Less trade—-in allowance on ammunition

Het Cost

of Alccermen of the Town of Chapel Hill
for 50 new revolvers

in the amount of $4,835.50 less a trade-in a)llowance for 50 used revolvers and
40 boxes of ammunition in the amount of $3,355.00.

This the 13th day of November, 1978.

THE MOT!ON WAS CARRIED UNANTMOUSLY .

ADOPTION OF THE

ALDERMAN SMITH MOVED, SECONED BY ALDERMAN

FOLLOWING RESOLUTION.

HOWES,

A RESOLUTION ACCEPTING BIDS AND AWARDING OF CONTRACT FOR MANHOLE AND CATCH BASIN
SUPPLIES

WHEREAS the Town of Chapel Hill has solicited formal bids on Manhole and Catch
Basin Supplics and the following bid has been received:

Bidder & Bid

Dewey Bros., Inc., Goldsboro, N.C.
Ttem TOTAL
10 Manhole Rings & Covers $ 662.00
10 Catch Basin Teps $ 773.00
5 Catch Basin Tops $ 417.00
5 Catch Basin Tops $ 328.75
‘5 Catch Basin Frames & Grates $ 422.50
5 Catch Basin Frames & Grates $ 517.50
10 Catch Basin Curb, Frame and
Grate Asscmblies $1,312.00
$4,432.75

.

NOW, THEREFCRE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Board of Aldermen of the Town of Chapel Hill
that the Town accepts the bid of Dewey Bros., Inc., in the amount of $4,432.75.

This the 13th day of November, 1978,

THE MOTION WAS CARRIED UNANIMOUSLY.

Resolution Concerning Mileage Rate Change

Alderman Thorne wanted the mileage rate raised to $.17. Mr.
that reimbursement rates should be

Shipman thought
based on certain factors. The staff had
not had time to substantiate these factors. They would consider this in
developing next vyear's budget and make recommendations to the Board.
However, if the rate was raised to $.17, thc staff would then find it hard to
recommend {owering the rate even should evidence indicate it. ALDERMAN
COHEN MOVED, SECONED BY ALDERMAN HOWES, ADOPTION OF THE FOLLOWING
RESOLUTION.
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DE 1T RESOLVED by the Board of Aldermens of  the Town of Chapel Hill th'zlxt
[ A [ FR - . - v .(; X R ¥ " :
the mileage reimbursement rate {or Town travel be revised from .10 per mile
to .15 per mite effective November 14, 1978,

‘|(\'7Q
N

This the 13th day of November,
THE MOTION WAS CARRIED BY A VOTE OF FIVE TO TWO WITH ALDERMEN
KAWALEC AND THORPE QOPPOCSING.

ALDERMAN SMITH MOVED, SECONED BY ALDERMAN HOWES, ADOPTION OF THE
FOLLOWING RESOLUTION,

A RESOLUTION CONCERNMING MILEAGE RATE CHANGE

BE IT RESOLVED by the Board of Aldermen of the Town of Chapel Hill that
the Town Manager is hereby dirccted to review the existing Town travel reim-
bursement obpolicies and recommend changes to be incornorated in the 1979-80

Budget.

This the 13th day of November, 1978,

THE MOTION WAS CARRIED UNANIMOUSLY.

Ordinance Cancelling the Second Regular Board of Aldermen Meeting in
December 1978

ALDERMAN SMITH MOVED, SECONDED BY ALDERMAN BOULTON, ADOPTION OF THE
FOLLOWING ORDINANCE.

AN ORDINANCE CANCCLLING THE SECOND REGULAR BOARD OF ALDERMEN MEETING IN DECEMBER, 1973

BE IT ORDAINED by the Board of Aldermen of the Town of Chapel Hill that the Board
hereby aimends Section 2-3 of the Code of Crdinances, Town of Chapel Hill, by adding th.
following clause to follow the word “August":

"and there shall he no meeting on the fourth Monday in December, 1973",

This the 13th day of Hovember, 1978.

THE MOTION WAS CARRIED UNANIMOUSLY.
Comm_ittees

The Board was notified that the Recreation Commission, the Transportation
Board, The Historic District Commission and the Appearance Commissiorn would
have vacancies at the end of December.

ALDERMAN HOWES MOVED, SECONDED BY ALDERMAN KAWALEC, TO ADJOURN _TO
EXECUTIVE SESISON TO DISCUSSION PERSONNEL MATTERS, AFTER WHICH THE
BOARD WOULD ADJOURN. THE MOTION WAS CARRIED UNANIMOUSLY.

e. wnllaca
DD @ RS20



